Bid Opening: 8-8-16
B.O.C. Approval:

FY2017 Football/Soccer Bid
Parks and Recreation Dept.

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
*DMS Does not meet specification Gilman All Star Riddell Pennant The Sports BSN Cannon R&S Coach's Team First Team
Gear Athletic Sports Sports Shop Sports Sports Sports Sports Sports Center
Gilman, CT Douglas, GA | Elyria, OH [Birmingham, AL | Waycross, GA |Jenkintown, PA| Burbank, CA Albany, GA [Little River, SC| Greenville, SC
ITEM| QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
A 720 |Jerseys No Bid No Bid $11,550.90 No Bid $8,560.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid DMS $9,789.00
B 100 |Football Pants No Bid No Bid $1,150.00 $1,687.00 $1,000.00 $1,490.80 No Bid $1,495.00 $1,375.00 $1,375.00
C 56 |Footballs No Bid $1,976.00 $2,143.68 $1,934.40 $1,824.00 $1,936.16 DMS $2,085.20 $2,912.00 $2,334.00
D 12 |Football Tees - Boomer 2" No Bid $57.00 $54.00 No Bid $30.00 $16.32 No Bid $54.00 $39.00 $34.80
E 72 |Chin Straps No Bid $270.00 $396.00 No Bid $288.00 $605.52 No Bid $212.40 $258.00 $648.00
F 100 |Rip Flags No Bid $360.00 $300.00 No Bid $169.00 $148.00 $174.00 $300.00 $300.00 $95.00
G 2 |Sets of Weighted Pylons $272.00 $90.00 $46.20 No Bid $90.00 $35.36 $93.98 $72.00 $45.90 $43.00
H 1 |[Set of Varsity Down Box & Chains $660.00 $235.00 $100.00 No Bid $189.00 $164.26 No Bid $169.95 $195.00 $239.00
| 2 |Sets of Side Line Markers $964.00 $240.00 $300.50 No Bid $390.00 $235.46 $373.18 $240.00 $235.00 $168.00
J 51 |Football Shoulder Pads No Bid $1,734.00 $1,351.50 $1,785.51 $1,290.30 $1,904.85 No Bid $1,493.45 $1,473.90 $1,785.00
K 115 |Helmets No Bid $12,650.00 $7,475.00 $6,967.85 $5,865.00 $7,621.05 No Bid $7,469.25 $8,050.00 $7,906.25
L 42 |Practice Soccer Balls No Bid $262.08 $307.74 No Bid $315.00 $138.96 $323.22 $459.90 $189.00 $333.90
M 24 |Game Soccer Balls No Bid $183.60 $415.80 $132.00 $214.00 $116.76 $241.92 $358.80 $168.00 $310.80
Low Group Bid Total: $0.00 $0.00 $100.00 $0.00 $18,539.80 $307.40 $0.00 $212.40 $0.00 $263.00
Recommend awarding for each group as follows:
Vendor: Group(s): Total:
Riddell, Ohio H $100.00
Sports Shop, Waycross, GA ABC,J K $18,539.80
BSN, Pennsylvania D,GL,M $307.40
R&S Sports, Albany $212.40
First Team, South Carolina Fl $263.00
Grand Total: $19,422.60




